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The candidates must fulfil the eligibility criteria as given below to appear in the Counselling; 

B. Tech 

(Lateral) 

Rajkiya Engineering College Banda 
Atarra, Banda -210201 

E-Mail : director@recbanda.ac.in URL Wwww.recbanda.ac.in 
Tel: +91 5191 254301 Mob:+91-8765089509 

ELIGIBILITY CRITERIA 
Admission 2023-24 

Eligibility Criteria 

Passed 10+2 examination and 
Obtained at least 45% marks (40% 
marks in case of candidates 
belonging to SC/ST category) in 
the subjects taken together. 

Passed Minimum THREE years / 
TWO years (Lateral Entry) Diploma 
examination with at least 45% 

marks (40% marks in case of 
candidates belonging to SC/ST 
category) in ANY branch of 
Engineering and Technology 
(except Agriculture Engg., 
Pharmacy and Architecture) from 
the institution located in UP and 
recognized by BTEUP. 

OR 

BTEUP 

Passed B.Sc. Degree from a 
recognized University as defined by 
UGC, with at least 45% marks 
(40% marks in case of candidates 
belonging to SC/ST category) and 
passed 10+2 examination with 
Mathematics as a subject. Will be 
allotted if seats remain vacant after 
allotment to Diploma Students. 

OR 
Passed D.Voc. Stream in the same 
or allied sector from the institution 

located' in UP and recognized by 

G29 

Subjects 
(Compulsory 
Required) 
Physics & 

Mathematics 

from list) 

Chemistry/ 
BioTechnolog 
y / Biology/ 
Technical 
Vocational 
subject 

Azadira Amit Mahotsav. 

Subjects (At Exam 
least One 

JEE (Main) 
2023/as per 

AKTU/UP 
Government 
Guidline 

as per 
AKTU/UP 
Government 
Guidline 

Note:- Above Eligibility Criteria is based on previous year Guidelines. In case of any 

chang in Guidelines from AKTU/UP Government. The same will be applicable for 2023 

24 admnission. 

Dean Academic_ 


